o RUTTONJEE

HOSPITAL
X Q=R 3

Medical Records Office

LG1/F, Hospital Main Building, Ruttonjee Hospital
266 Queen’s Road East, Wan Chai, Hong Kong
Tel.: 2291 2154 Fax: 2834 1227

Opening hours:

Monday -Friday:

2:00 p.m. to 5:00 p.m
Saturday, Sunday & Closed
Public Holidays:

9:00am. to 1:00 p.m. and

TANG SHIU KIN ®
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Data Access Request - Scale of Fees Applicable from 18.6.2017

Copy Data Request for the Supply of Personal Data

Processing Fee

Reproduction charge for the 11" page
and onward

Reproduction charge for ECG, EEG or
X-ray Film etc.

ARTHER ey i F-

: HK$76 per request

(inclusive of reproduction charge for
not more than 10 pages and postage)

: HK$1 per page

: HK$230 per modality per disc

HK$230 per film
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FORM1 #{#-
DATA ACCESSREQUEST R F# & &

(Except with the consent of the individual concerned, the personal data collected in this Form will be used
for the purpose of processing this data access request and other directly related purposes only.)

(BEE ALK » ERIEHERTN BRI T 5 e 2 I TR 2 o] P R R B B B R Je Y H Y )

(A data user is required by the Personal Data (Privacy) Ordinance to comply with a DAR within 40 days after receiving the
same. |If a data user is unable to comply with the DAR within the 40-day period, it must inform the requestor by notice in
writing that it is so unable and the reasons, and comply with the DAR to the extent it is able to within the same 40-day
period and thereafter comply or fully comply with it as soon as practicable. When medically necessary, a patient may
authorize his/her private medical practitioner to contact the Hospital Authority’s responsible doctor to obtain his/her
medical information.)

(EHHEHT D TRIREE (AN B (RS ) BEPIHISE » TR E B EATBREHII0A N » IIEZ TR ER - HEFHE
[HETHEFR A0 H e 2 TR R BRI B - s R TE40 H TR L BB A1 B R B BERE B MR
& » WM GE IR 2R B B B R A ETE Y - (K2R BRI RN BR - M B JRTF ¢ B o 1T HY 8B P22 R 1
B R AR A B BT ER - NEN KB LI TR » WA I RERY R L RSB E TS BN
PN LTIGEENS > )

SECTION I ¥ - 265

(This Section Must Be Completed #2654 F 4 &)

1. Data User &g # & .
Name of HA Institution from which Personal Data is requested:
%ﬂ@iiﬁﬁﬁ%%4?ﬂﬁ§§%%ﬁ?ﬁi

Ruttonjee & Tang Shiu Kin Hospitals

By E METER
[
2. Details of the Data Subject who must be a living individual T3 & A (&5 5 2 A 1)
(@ Name+4: % : (English) ( )
Surname 4+ < Forename % & Chinese » ~ 4+ %
(b)  Sex: *Male/Female (c) *HKID Card No ./ Passport No.:
AR *3 S * *H kY /R
(d) Age
i |:| Under 18 years of age |:| 18 years of age or over
bt & R EAREA.

(e)  Address ¥ &t:

(f)  Daytime Telephone No (9) Any other contact number(s)
S S BERE TR

# If the HKID Card No. is provided, no copy or physical production of the HKID Card is required in case the
number provided is accurate and corresponds to the number recorded on HA's database. If not, a true copy of the
HKID Card will be required for verification. Alternatively, the HKID Card may be physically produced for
verification at our hospital. H ZHIDAELDEGREE 7 HRTEFI ,ﬁigf;ff“/,;, FALR 9f fe g errgE
BE o EFRELDT FELPFETRNEREFERF o FF ) FHRRGAELPEGERF AL
R T BELBET A NEG

If the Passport No. is provided, please produce in person the original or provide a true copy of the Passport of
the Data Subject when submitting this Data Access Request to our hospital.  # #=74 < E# 5L - s 2 /2
Bk TERFHEE R BT TG ATEEL RS B A -

O please tick the appropriate box - &if § 7 &+ 4« 3
* delete whichever is inappropriate ##{2 % if * :‘Ff
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3. Details of Personal Data of the Data Subject under request (“Requested Data”) are:

FHRETASE REF PR TR (T2 T4 )l

# [Further information may be required to enable us to identify and/or locate the Requested Data. Please specify
clearly and in detail the Requested Data. Too general a description of the Requested Data such as “all of my
personal data” may render the request being refused if we are not supplied with such information as we may
reasonably require to locate the Requested Data.] # ( iz 74 FER EL F FHNE & pavfc & 445 i
B L FAL o gfr;i,fm;; PR B S Y SRR Y R R RN R
Hy o RRTEGESE L F]Z R R EREZD DR T LT R RG]

(@) Fortheperiod § % B 3l chfp F:

(b)  Forthe foIIowing DupIicated Medical Record at the Institution:
TRERD T TR T R oA+

I:l A&E record & 5 & & Plain X-ray # i Xs& 5 [ &% I:l discsk % I:l Reportig £
I:l Inpatient record it % & C.T.Scan & *a¥ ¥ : I:l discsk I:l Reportig £
|:| Out-patient record P # B2 & & MRl & #4 £ §&: |:| discs g |:| Reportsg £,
|:| Discharge Summary ! i & Ultra-sound film 4z B3t : |:| discsk # |:| Reportsg £,
|:| Investigation Reportst& 5 4F 4. , pls specify 3> : I:l Others please specify # # (7P ):

Others please specify:
26 GHIP)

(c)  Name(s) of Person(s) at the Institution who may be involved are (if available):

VAR TR D F S Lt (e )

# Please provide information on separate sheets, if the space provided is insufficient.

HAe P 2K FR GRS R B

(d) Isthis the first time that the Requested Data is requested? £.% % — st & £ & B #7& £ FHL ?

[] Yes & [] Noz

If no, please state the number of times where such a request has previously been made?

FE OGP LY & R

[]29as= dai== [

() Exclusions # B 7

| do not require any personal data which is:
hARFERT R A TR

L] contained in documents which had previously been provided to the Data User by the Data Subject

(e.g. letters to the Data User and/or the Relevant Person (as mentioned under Section Il below)
from the Data Subject) ~ §** FAF F A am f » TR Y FH ke BRSO TR
(4ot FTHEF A w TR HE/EG M AL (e 2 A AT e )

contained in documents which had previously been provided to the Data Subject by the Data User
(e.g. letters to the Data Subject and/or the Relevant Person from the Data User or documents the
Data User had provided to the Data Subject and/or the Relevant Person pursuant to a previous

request) oo o Ié%—%’fllau%rf}vp‘} FE AR B BN R TR TR
A FRE T AR /EG M AL D S TR Y K B LR ]l\rp\ STy

B M KL s @)

O please tick the appropriate box 3 tif 4 % 44+ e V5
* delete whichever is inappropriate ##{2 % if * ﬁ
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L] in the public domain (e.g. newspaper clippings or entries in public registers concerning the Data
Subject)
B A AT R FOFT R (bl4e  FTF TR & 28 Fep pHOTRE TR

L] set out below (please describe as fully as possible):
rTr "‘1‘z+ (f—é 5 3’— H’J;}E U )

4, Nature of Request * & f ¢ 7 :

|:| (@) Data Enquiry Request # 3 7 & -
The Institution will inform the Data Subject (or where appropriate, the Relevant Person) whether
it holds or does not hold the Requested Data.
THERFEFEA T REEA (RFHAL) B3 X285 FHRFF AL RFTH -

|:| (b)  Copy Data Request 7 #l4g & & -

The Institution will inform the Data Subject (or where appropriate, the Relevant Person) whether it
holds or does not hold the Requested Data.
THBHEFEATREEL (S ML) BEFEG S AIFE THRGE L DL R

The Institution will provide a copy of the Requested Data to the Data Subject (or where

appropriate, the Relevant Person). If only (b) [Copy Data Request] is ticked, the request will be

deemed to be both (a) [Data Enquiry Request] and (b) [Copy Data Request]. The fee applicable

for a Copy Data Request is listed in the Data Access Request Scale of Fees (“Scale of Fees”).
DHPEFTRERRTREPI A A FTRFFA(FFRALD) e n EBHRID TF
A AR R > BAARTRFRN () TAFTHEER 2 (D) TEMREAE R, g
TERAF AR R e o T AR TR R d A e 2O o

5. If a medical report is required, please specify:
Yok TR R B - DFRIFL P

|:| this has previously been prepared/supplied, or % & » % & 58 % /4% Bt FRARL &

|:| this has not previously been prepared/supplied. # & f&A & </ # it F 5 4% 2

(# If a report has not previously been prepared/supplied, this will be excluded from the Requested Data and

NOT be dealt with as a request under the Personal Data (Privacy) Ordinance. A separate application for a

medical report may be submitted to our hospital. Please refer to the applicable scale of charges.)

(# A%k & B m R E L %‘)%3‘? R %g’”g Fgopsp Fl“f IR RZ T E
(i 4 Fa (F78) 1'%‘.w>>f‘fi‘l‘“iﬁﬁéiw‘?’ﬂ-?5)%?§ﬁ TV fEe AR o R R RE o)

6.  Mode of Collection 4B~ & Filens 3N :
The requested items would be sent to you by registered mail unless you specify one of the following choice.
x{]:j FEREHE TR A A1ﬂm-» NLOE PR R Rehip A ?,}iﬂz‘g H AR E A
lwishto ~ 4 # ¥ :

D Collect the Personal Data in person. Please inform me when the data is ready for collection.
ML ARPT R i A FAL, AT MARB TR Aok 4 o

D others, please specify # & [ 3=Lp )

O please tick the appropriate box 3 tif 4 % 44+ e V5
* delete whichever is inappropriate ##{2 % if * ﬁ
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SECTION Il #_- #85

(To Be Completed if a Relevant Person Applies for Access on behalf of the Data Subject Referred to in
Section| ek A€ 72 7 7 M AL AR & - PR PFHGERF KL, FIFHEBLIPER)

1. Details of the Relevant Person 3 B £ 4 ¥4

(@) Name 4+ &: (English) ( )
Surname ¥+ = Forename % % Chinese ¥ < 4+ %
(b)  Sex: *Male/Female
pu) 7 /4
(¢) *HKID Card No.: / Passport No.:
*H kL EYE RIS

(d)  Address ¥ 4t:

(e)  Daytime Telephone No P ¥ B35 & 7 35 50/

() Any other contact number(s) H i 5 % T L 545

# Please produce in person the original or provide a true copy of the HKID Card/Passport of the
Relevant Person when submitting this Data Access Request. # o ARKEIA TBRFHE

Ky R GFRLA TG AL G EL L EEDT RRERE AR

2. Relationship between the Relevant Person and the Data Subject, which can be (tick as appropriate):

FHALAFTHFAOMGLFLT Y - F o gagd HERRE

EITHER ] (d) The Relevant Person has parental responsibility for the Data Subject who is under

g # agel8; FHFFA AL AB L AA A FHALHEHTEIEA G A F i,

OR [l (b) The Relevant Person has been duly authorised by the Data Subject to submit this Data

= Access Request and to collect the Requested Data on behalf of the Data Subject;
FHALETHEY R ARERIA TARTHR R, 02 S HRR RTH

OR ] (c) The Data Subject is incapable of managing his own affairs and the Relevant Person has

B been appointed by a court to manage the affairs of the Data Subject; F 4% % % 4 & it *
FRALEDR FHALEZRESFEFRTREE T A PF R

OR ] (d) The Data Subject is mentally incapacitated within the meaning of the Mental Health

& Ordinance and the Relevant Person is: F 44 % % B (#4¢ /& i b)) “rdp i 4d 2

EFLasht >z AL s

[l appointed as a guardian of the Data Subject by a court, magistrate or the
Guardianship Board under section 44A, 590 or 59Q of the Mental Health
Ordinance; §d 2 Fe ~ £ 2 F 2T H LR ¢ ¥ (A ERIEL) &
444 ~ 590245901k & = 5 TR E F A hEE A

[] the Director of Social Welfare who, pursuant to section 44B(2A) or 59T (1) of the

O please tick the appropriate box - &if § 7 &+ 4« 3
* delete whichever is inappropriate 312 7 i * ¥

RH MRD DAR Form1 (JUN 2025) Page 4/7H



Mental Health Ordinance, is vested the guardianship of the Data Subject; 4+ ¢ 48
T F L O R 5 6) % 44BRD) S O0T(D R iF F# 3§ % 4 o

it

[] the Director of Social Welfare or a person approved by the Guardianship Board
who, pursuant to section 44B(2B) or 59T(2) of the Mental Health Ordinance is
authorised to perform the functions of a guardian for the Data Subject. A+ ¢ 4%
FRFEATELR T A L 13 (HA B E6) ¥ 44B(2B) &
SIT(2) W BMARFER T T F F 4 hE L T -

If the box in 2(d) is ticked, state the date when the Relevant Person was appointed a guardian/was vested the
guardianship / was authorised to perform the functions of a guardian:
E R FRETHAIARLTER S REFERERERFER AL S P

Is the appointment / vesting / authority to perform under 2(d) still subsisting? F i£2(d)7& s4 i= /ﬁ%ﬁfﬁ/#}%

BRELE AT E

[IYes® [ INo=

# Please also provide a true copy of the documentary evidence to support the relationship between the Relevant
Person and the Data Subject. Please refer to Note for examples of the documentary supporting evidence.
# o AREREN G MALETRFEAZEMNGIER Y P LR S FP Y EHF T AR

O please tick the appropriate box - &if § 7 &+ 4« 3
* delete whichever is inappropriate #14 % i *
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SECTION Il # = 285

(A Copy Data Request Will Not Be Processed Unless Accompanied by a Processing Fee)
[ TEHGrEL) FRPRIZFHR » EF#HT T LI )

1. The Data Subject and (where appropriate) the Relevant Person have read and understood the Scale of Fees.
?;}ig ¥ AZ 4’5 BE AL (.ﬁpiﬁ’k dﬂz) A ‘3‘]7%_,1‘1'.;19%@1;:%‘3 2 54—375/;%?‘3 oo

2. Copy Data Request is accompanied by a Processing Fee of:
"FHAE AR A, B AIEY R

HK% % $

Rl

* Payment by Cash / Payment by Crossed Cheque (Payable to: Hospital Authority) Cheque No.

issued by

*UIREHRAE G FRERL)AS L ERAS ’
EEAERE S

Note: The appropriate receipt should be collected from the shroff and attached to this Form.
VLR GRS ) e g e A Y ,;;—zi 0

DECLARATION AND SIGNATURES #pP 2 ¥ %

WHERE applicable, the Data Subject has irrevocably authorised the Relevant Person to deal with this Data Access Request and
to collect the Requested Data on behalf of the Data Subject. The Data Subject and (where appropriate) the Relevant Person
understand and agree that all applicable fees listed in the Scale of Fees have to be paid prior to collection of the Requested Data.

The Data Subject and (where appropriate) the Relevant Person declare that the information given in this Data Access Request
Form is accurate.

B HEIRT > FREET A 2 MALE N VMR AL A A TR T A REAS TAR
THE R ) ZAPRE KT FRFFAZFHAL (dog JF‘T) PBEZ PR G AT 73
PAPE R s A TR RFTA

Signature of Data Subject: Date :
Ty E AR R p

If application by Relevant Person: ¢ 7 B ¢ L& 2 ¥ 3

Signature of Relevant Person (if applicable): Date
FHALEF o ) o

O please tick the appropriate box - &if § 7 &+ 4« 3
* delete whichever is inappropriate 312 7 i * ¥
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Note:

L

Examples of documentary evidence to support the relationship between the Relevant Person and the Data Subject are:
A THEFE LT Y Lol Gomap < to)+ 5 -

(@)

(b)

(©

(d)

(€

a hirth certificate/legal custody paper if the Relevant Person claims parental responsibility over the Data subject;
or

DA A A EEEDF(FFMALREHTEGEAG A FE) A

an original authorization form signed by the Data Subject where the Relevant Person claims to have been duly
authorised by the Data Subject; or

FHFEAFFRPL T REF WAL EFRG T peff) | o

a court document issued by a court appointing the Relevant Person to manage the affairs of the Data Subject
who is incapable of managing his own affairs; or

EFEGF AL EFHGFREARERRR S (FFHEFE A a A g EALETR)
E"

a guardianship order issued by the Guardianship Board/court/magistrate which can show that the Relevant
Person is currently appointed as the guardian of the mentally incapacitated Data Subject; or

IS 2 Ve ) e A T N RO N RS A N

41/(‘7767’;:;%/( ;_E.

documentary evidence to show that the Relevant Person has been vested the guardianship or that he is
authorised to perform the functions of a guardian under the relevant section of the Mental Health Ordinance.

P PET ML (AR ER) ol ERFE RS ERESTE &

ib°

[]

FOR OFFICIAL USEONLY #H#r &% 4 k58

The Data Subject’s *HKID Card / Passport Number(s) *has / have been checked against

by [name of staff] on

The Relevant Person’s *HKID Card / Passport Number(s) *has / have been checked against the

original by [name of staff] on

The Relevant Person’s *HKID Card / Passport Number(s) *has / have been checked against the

COpY (original not seen) by [name of staff] on

O please tick the appropriate box 3 tif 4 % 44+ e V5
* delete whichever is inappropriate ##{2 % if * A‘f
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